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 April 8th - Start of the 4th Quarter!

 

April 10th – PSAT8 Testing Day.  8th grade students 
will test in the morning and then continue with hours 
4, lunch, 5 and 6. 

6th and 7th grade students will arrive at 11:10 am 
followed by hours 4, lunch, 5 and 6. For students that 
ride the bus, please be at your stop 3 hour and 15 
minutes later than your usual time. 

Dismissal for all students on April 10th is at 3:04 
pm.

 

April 12th – Choir Chocolate Chip Cookie Sale - Cost: 
2 cookies for $1. 

The “Got Sneakers” Reuse, Recycle, Raise Money 
Campaign is going on through the end of the school 
year.  Please donate GYM SHOES ONLY – IN ANY 
CONDITION. Wearable gym shoes will be given to 
people in need. Non-wearable gym shoes will be 
recycled, and our Lancer Choir receives a few dollars 
for every pair.  Students can leave gym shoes in the 



bin as they enter school.  Help people, the 
environment and our Lancer Choir. 

 

ATHLETICS: 

The first track Practice will be on Monday 4/8/24 after 
school until 4:45. Students wanting to participate 
need a sports physical on file at MSC or to turn one 
in at the first practice. Please see Mr. Chalk with 
questions or email at chalkev@lc-ps.org 

L’Anse Creuse High School and L’Anse Creuse High 
School North are pleased to announce that we are 
collaborating to host our 1st Annual 3v3 Basketball 
Tournament on June 8 & 9.  This year’s event will 
be located at L’Anse Creuse High School North.  This 
is a two-day, outside event open to kids ages 12-18 
inside and outside of the district. Registration is open 
now through May 24.  Each team must have four 
players and the cost for the event is $180+fees 
through SchoolPay.  That’s only $45 per 
player!  Each player will receive a T-Shirt at 
registration.  Trophies and medals will be awarded for 
the top three teams in each bracket.  Each team is 
guaranteed 3 games.  There will be a Battle for 
Redemption for teams who lose their first two 
games.  Eligibility and Rules, along with a sample 
bracket are located on the registration link at 
bit.ly/LC3V3  3v3 Flyer 

 

Congratulations to our MSC Artists whose work is on 
display at the Anton Art center! You can check out 
their work for the Macomb County Annual Secondary 
Student Show until April 13th.

 

Book Club is now on Tuesdays and Wednesdays in 
the Media Center. Grab your lunch and bring a book 
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to read.

 

The LCHS stadium is currently under construction. 
For the safety of our students, staff and the 
community, the stadium is not accessible until further 
notice.

 

COMMUNITY EDUCATION: 

LC Community Education is hosting another “Off to a 
Great Start” for incoming 6th grade students.  This is 
a great program to prepare new 6th grade students 
for the transition to middle school.  Class sizes are 
limited, and pre-registration is required. See the  Off to 
a Great Start flyer  

The Youth Cornhole Organization is hosting cornhole 
through at MSC from April 30th through June 4th – 
6:30 pm to 7:45 pm.  This is open for students grades 
3 through 8. See the attached Cornhole Organization 
Flyer for more details. 

Summer 2024 Youth Music lessons at Kawaii Studios 
are being offered beginning the week of June 
15th.  See the attached flyer for more information: 
Kawaii Studios  

 

UPCOMING DATES: 

April 17th – Band Cedar Point Trip Informational 
Meeting – 6:30 pm in the cafeteria 

April 23rd – Band Cedar Point Rehearsal – 3:10 to 
4:10 pm in the Band Room 

April 24th – Band Cedar Point Parent Meeting – 6:30 
pm in the Band Room 

April 25th – Family Night – 6:30 pm - all MSC families 
are welcome to attend. 

#BERELENTLESS 
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receiving all email messages distributed through our SchoolMessenger service, follow this link 
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